
Dog TalesDog Tales

Pictures of Shelter

1 Example Way,  King  City, ON Email

Phone

“I’ve 
adopted 2 
dogs from 

Dog 
Tales.”

Dog Tales was 
founded in 2014 by 
an animal-loving 
husband and wife - 
Rob and Danielle. 
Both had been 
involved in rescue 
for years before
finally deciding that the best way 
to help animals was to open a 
rescue of their own. 



The luxurious kennel space is 
one of the things that sets Dog 
Tales apart from other resuces in 
the world. We believe that our 
dogs deserve all the comforts of 
home while htey wait for their 
forever homes. 

Adoptable Dogs

Home Search Profile

Apply to AdoptMy Shelter

Kid Friendly

Max 4 years

Video of Dog

Selective 

With Dogs No Cats

Medium Energy Special Needs

(Blind)

Requires 

Fenced Backyard

Breed: Husky

Good with other dogs? No

Good with kids? Yes

House trained? Yes

Special needs? Blind

Likes to snuggle? Yes, very.

Basic commands? No.

Aggressive Tendencies? Needs
space when eating food.

Crate trained? Yes

Bio: This handsome guy has 

Home Search Profile

been at our shelter since January 
1, 2021. He hasn’t had an easy life 
and has a history of abuse. He is 
shy around men but isn’t 
aggressive. He is very sweet and 
loves snuggling on the couch. 



Max is blind and would need an 
owner who would be willing to 
work on sound commands with 
him as he was never taught basic 
commands (sit, stay, etc.). He 
would also always need to be on 
leash during walks. 



Max’s perfect home would have a 
fenced back yard, have some kids 
to run around with and would go 
on a long walk daily. 

Name*

First Name Last Name

Phone Number*

Email*

Which dog are you interested in?*

Number of people in home*

Address*

Address 1

City

Adults

(18+)

Home type*
House 

Basement Apartment

Apartment/Condo

Acreage

Yard type*
Fully fenced 

Semi fenced

No fence

Electric fence

Stake in ground wtih long line

No Yard

Yes

No

Teens 
(14-17)*

Children

(0-13)

Postal Code

Province

How many hours each day will 
the dog be home alone?*

Have you had a dog before?*

Yes

No

Have you had a dog before?*

Save to Profile

Sign up for notifications about 

dogs that match your profiles
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Find your best match

Name*

First Name Last Name

Phone Number*

Email*

Which dog are you interested in?*

Number of people in home*

Address*

Address 1

City

Adults

(18+)

Home type*
House 

Basement Apartment

Apartment/Condo

Acreage

Yard type*
Fully fenced 

Semi fenced

No fence

Electric fence

Stake in ground wtih long line

No Yard

Yes

No

Teens 
(14-17)*

Children

(0-13)

Postal Code

Province

How many hours each day will 
the dog be home alone?*

Have you had a dog before?*

Yes

No

Have you had a dog before?*

Save to Profile

Sign up for notifications about 

dogs that match your profiles

Send Application

Home Search Profile

Kid 

Friendly

Story Story Story

Logo

Home Search Profile

Story

Max 4

Read more

FenceBlind

Browse on my own

Find your best match

Fill out a survey to find 
adoptable dogs perfect 

for you.

Photo of Dog

Get Started

Improving the dog 
adoption process 

one paw at a 
time.

Raise a Paw

Keep Browsing Dogs

Thank you for your 
application. You will be 

notified if you are 
moved to the next 

phase to adopt Max.

Home Search Profile


